

5/23/2023

BID TABULATION
BID 23-15 READY MIX CONCRETE & FLOWABLE FILL

VENDOR	2500 CY CLASS S (6 SACK) TRK CHG EST = 75		400 CY CLASS A (5 SACK) TRK CHG EST = 20		300 CY C & G (3/8" PEA GRAVEL, 6 SACK) TRK CHG EST = 20		400 CY CLASS C-C (7 SACK) TRK CHG EST = 20		800 CY FLOWABLE FILL TRK CHG EST = 30		TRUCK CHG EST. 165 (15 MIN)
	UNIT	SUBTOTAL	UNIT	SUBTOTAL	UNIT	SUBTOTAL	UNIT	SUBTOTAL	UNIT	SUBTOTAL	
DIAMOND M CONCRETE WICHITA FALLS, TX	\$ 150.00	\$ 375,000.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 56,000.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 45,000.00	NO BID		NO BID		N/A
FALLS REDI-MIX WICHITA FALLS, TX	\$ 135.00	\$ 337,500.00	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		\$ 104.00	\$ 83,200.00	\$ 30.00
OK CONCRETE CO WICHITA FALLS, TX	\$ 151.00 * 3 yard limit	\$ 377,500.00	\$ 145.00	\$ 58,000.00	\$ 156.25	\$ 46,875.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 64,000.00	\$ 127.00	\$ 101,600.00	\$ 25.00
If quantity is 5 yards or more the first 60 minutes are included in the cost. \$100 per hour charge after the first hour.											